
OPPORTUNITIES
EMS promotional track, specialty
teams (tech rescue, rescue swimmer,
fire investigation, & more) and other
leadership roles.

EXCELLENT
COMPENSATION

Annual salary is $121,180 with
additional premiums available,
including education & longevity.

Work on beautiful Bainbridge
Island, just a short ferry ride from
downtown Seattle. 

Immediate openings for

LATERAL
FIREFIGHTER
PARAMEDIC

ABOUT US

WHY WORK FOR US?

Bainbridge Island Fire Department
(BIFD) is a combination department
founded in 1942. BIFD is staffed by    
 43 career staff, 14 volunteers, and  
 nine administrative personnel. We
work a 48/96 schedule and operate
out of three stations, responding to
over 3,000 calls for service each 
 year. Our EMS program is based on
the King County Medic One system,
with medic units staffed with two
paramedics. 

To learn more & apply, visit bifd.org

GENEROUS BENEFITS
Our package includes initial sick &
vacation leave banks, deferred
compensation with 5% match, tuition
assistance, and medical, dental, &
retirement.

HIRING INCENTIVES
Generous hiring bonuses and
promissory note payoff available.
Inquire at applications@bifd.org.

http://www.bifd.org/
mailto:applications@bifd.org

